

Custodial Supply Recap
2017-2018
Awarded December 7, 2017

PE	Description	Unit of Measure	Central Sanitary Supply	K.W. Solutions Inc.	Randik Paper Co.	Sac Val Janitorial Supply Inc.	Awarded To:
1	Wax Stripper	2-Liter	36.90	No Bid	29.76*	91.36	Randik Paper Co.
2	Heavy Duty Cleaner (32 oz. bottle)	Case	31.90	No Bid	34.20*	36.78	Randik Paper Co.
3	Disinfectant Neutral Cleaner (23H Quat)	2-Liter	24.90	No Bid	22.18*	23.54	Randik Paper Co.
4	Window Cleaner	2-Liter	27.40*	No Bid	30.29	38.29	Central Sanitary Supply
5	Porcelain, Tile & Grout Cleaner (for foaming machine)	Case	35.88	No Bid	33.60*	33.00	Randik Paper Co.
6	Alcohol Free Foaming Hand Sanitizer SAMPLE REQUIRED	Case	44.82	No Bid	43.81*	41.95	Randik Paper Co.
7	Foaming Antibacterial Skin Cleanser SAMPLE REQUIRED	Case	43.90	No Bid	42.60*	38.15	Randik Paper Co.
8	Garbage Liners (24x33) SAMPLE REQUIRED	Case	28.19	No Bid	21.48*	32.00	Randik Paper Co.
9	Garbage Liners (36x60) SAMPLE REQUIRED	Case	24.10	25.90*	21.17	27.29	K.W. Solutions
10	Disposable Gloves (M) (Medical Grade) SAMPLE REQUIRED	Box	2.37*	No Bid	2.56	2.46	Central Sanitary Supply
11	Disposable Gloves (L) (Medical Grade) SAMPLE REQUIRED	Box	2.37*	No Bid	2.56	2.46	Central Sanitary Supply
12	Disposable Gloves (XL) (Medical Grade) SAMPLE REQUIRED	Box	2.37*	No Bid	2.56	2.46	Central Sanitary Supply
13	Roll Toilet Tissue SAMPLE REQUIRED	Case	28.90*	No Bid	31.50	40.40	Central Sanitary Supply
14	Roll Towel (7.875" x 800', 6 rolls per case - total 4,800 feet per case) SAMPLE REQUIRED	Case	15.25	16.50*	17.20	No Bid	K.W. Solutions
14 (a)	Roll Towel (7.875" x 800', 12 rolls per case - total 6,400 sq. ft. per case) SAMPLE REQUIRED	Case	28.80	32.50*	No Bid	39.99	K.W. Solutions
15	Gym Floor Finish	5-gal	223.00	No Bid	231.60*	231.65	Randik Paper Co.
16	Gym Floor Finish Activator	12.7 oz.	33.00	No Bid	38.61	38.17*	Sac Val Janitorial Supply Inc.
17	Gym Floor Re-Coat Adhesion	5-gal	100.00	No Bid	133.20*	127.61	Randik Paper Co.
18	Resilient Finish	5-gal	60.00	No Bid	61.25*	52.50	Randik Paper Co.